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Background 
 
1. The Adaptation Fund Board (the Board) during its thirty-third meeting, approved a five-
year project titled “Integrated climate-resilient transboundary flood risk management in the Drin 
River basin in the Western Balkans” in Albania, Montenegro, and North Macedonia, submitted 
by the United Nations Development Programme (UNDP) for a requested amount of 
US$9,927,750.00 (Decision B.33/40).  
 
2. The objective of the project is to assist the riparian countries in the implementation of an 
integrated climate-resilient river basin flood risk management approach in order to improve their 
existing capacity to manage flood risk at regional, national and local levels, and to enhance 
resilience of vulnerable communities in the Drin River Basin (DRB) to climate-induced floods. 
The countries will benefit from a basin-wide transboundary flood risk management (FRM) 
framework based on improved climate risk knowledge and information; improved transboundary 
cooperation arrangements, including a policy framework and concrete FRM interventions.  

 
3. As mandated by the decision, an agreement was prepared and signed between the Board 
and UNDP on 07 May 2019 and the programme started implementation on 22 October 2019. 

 

4. The project Implementing Entity (IE) submitted three project performance reports (PPRs), 
which have been cleared by the secretariat, as well as a Mid-Term Review. As of the date of the 
issuance of this document, an amount of US$ 9,011,537.00 including the project fees, has been 
disbursed by the trustee, which corresponds to 91 per cent of the approved grant. 

 
5. On 3 May 2024, UNDP submitted a request for twelve-months no-cost extension of the 
project completion date, from 22 October 2024 to 22 October 2025. As outlined in  the 
Adaptation Fund Project/Programme Delay Policy (AFB/B.34-35/6), an implementing entity may 
request for a project/programme extension beyond the original completion date for up to 18 
months for a concrete adaptation project/programme if (i) no additional funds are required; (ii) the 
project/programme’s originally approved scope will not change; and (iii) the entity provides 
reasons and justifications for the extension. 

 
6. The reasons for this request, as outlined in the memo shared by UNDP, are due to: (i) 
the global COVID-19 pandemic outbreak which coincided with the commencement of the 
project, impacting negatively on the coordination with the key stakeholders, on travel and with 
the setting of the Project Management Unit; (ii) frequent changes in the government; (iii) census 
data not being published in Albania and North Macedonia, leading to hamper data gathering; (iv) 
cyber-attacks at the government e-infrastructure in Montenegro and Albania in 2022 which 
nearly paralyzed operations of public institutions during summer and autumn, thus adding 
impact on timelines of project activities.  
 
7. Activities planned under the project Outcome 1 have been completed, and the project 
foresees to entirely complete activities under Outcome 2 by the original completion date. The 
extension will, therefore, enable the finalization of the activities under Component 3. In addition, 
the extension will enable the integration of strategic results of this project into the knowledge 
management strategy.  

 
Secretariat’s review of the request 

 
8. Following a review of the request by the secretariat and considering the explanation 
provided by UNDP, the secretariat is of the view that this twelve-months no-cost extension request   
is justified. As evidenced by the memo provided by UNDP (Annex 1), it is noted that this request 
would allow sufficient time for the project to compensate for accumulated delays
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faced in the project implementation and ensure the fulfillment of the project outcomes. It is also 
noted, that this project extension was recommended by the project mid-term evaluation.  

 
9. Finally, the secretariat acknowledges that this no-cost project extension request has been 
agreed with the Executing Entities, and the Designated Authorities were notified, in accordance 
with the Adaptation Fund Policy for Project/Programme Delays, as specified in Annex 1. 

 

Recommendation 
 
10. The Board may consider and decide to approve the request for a twelve-months no-cost 
extension of the project completion date from 22 October 2024 to 22 October 2025, for the 
project “Integrated climate-resilient transboundary flood risk management in the Drin River basin 
in the Western Balkans” in Albania, Montenegro, and North Macedonia, as requested by UNDP. 
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Annex 1: Request for an extension of the project completion date from UNDP 
 

 



AFB/B.42-43/10 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 



AFB/B.42-43/10 
 

 


